SAN Luis OBISPO COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING AND BUILDING

Promoting the wise use of land - Helping to build great communities

DATE: 1/12/2015
TO:

FROM: BRANDI CUMMINGS, 805-781-1006, BCummings@co.slo.ca.us
COASTAL Team / Development Review

PROJECT DESCRIPTION: DRC2015-00076 SHELBY MUP, PROPOSED 1083 SF ADDITION TO
EXISTING 1172 SFR LOCATED AT 525 PACIFIC, CAYUCOS, APN: 064-144-011

Return this letter with your comments attached no later than 14 days from receipt of this referral.
CACs please respond within 60 days. Thank you.

PART 1 - IS THE ATTACHED INFORMATION ADEQUATE TO COMPLETE YOUR REVIEW?

U  YES (Please go on to PARTII.)
d NO (Call me ASAP to discuss what else you need. We have only 10 days in
which we must obtain comments from outside agencies.)

PART Il - ARE THERE SIGNIFICANT CONCERNS, PROBLEMS OR IMPACTS IN YOUR AREA
OF REVIEW?

QO YES (Please describe impacts, along with recommended mitigation measures to
reduce the impacts to less-than-significant levels, and attach to this letter.)
O NO (Please goonto PARTIIL)
PART Il - INDICATE YOUR RECOMMENDATION FOR FINAL ACTION.
Please attach any conditions of approval you recommend to be incorporated into the
project's approval, or state reasons for recommending denial.

IF YOU HAVE "NO COMMENT," PLEASE SO INDICATE, OR CALL.

Date Name Phone

COUNTY GOVERNMENT CENTER o SAN LuIS OBISPO o CALIFORNIA 93408 o (805) 781-5600

planning@co.slo.ca.us e FAX:(805)781-1242 e sloplanning.org



GENERAL APPLICATION FORM

DRC2015-00076 SHELBY DIANE

APPLICATION TYPE - CHECK ALL THAT APPLY MINOR USE PERMIT

QO Emergency Permit Q Tree Permit O Minor Use Permit 1083 SQ FT ADDITION TO EXISTING 1172 SQ
Q Conditional Use Permit/Development Plan Q Plot Plan  FT SFR

Q Curb, Gutter & Sidewalk Waiver O Other Q Site Plan EST/ CAYU

Q Surface Mining/Reclamation Plan Q Zoning Clearance CAZ LCP RSF SSN

QO Amendment to approved land use permit Q Variance

APPLICANT INFORMATION Check box fc:&ontact person assigned to this project _

Q Landowner Namw Zhned oy Daytime Phone X255 -48%-2286
Mailing Address ) ac+ L Ave Coedpe 0% Zip Code__ 9=%4 2D

Email Address: ] v

Q Applicant Name | Daytime Phone
Mailing Address Zip Code
Email Address:
gent Name Soln MQ@"\#S\J[ Daytime Phone _ 0% -975-1393
Mailing Address ___ 1§13 i ParWala  Ave Zip Code 2450

Email Address: SMeede clhaetts . ek
PROPERTY INFORMATION

Total Size of Site: __ 4 577792 Assessor Parcel Number(s):_ O&4: 1 44-0\\
Legal Description: Lo t4 T3\ @ Qoo Cobles Boach 2 |
Address of the project (if known): 2748 Pac-€c Cupucos

Directions to the site (including gate codes) - describe first with name of road providing primary access to
the site, then nearest roads, landmarks, etc.._ Cec B Aoce

Describe current uses, existing structures, and other improvements and vegetation on the property:
£ HKiwg €

PROPOSED PROJECT {
Describe the proposed project (inc. sq. ft. of all buildings): ‘ % % (5 2 ‘Q : @&At’i’wu "l'o
£ g vna U772 a2 =e

LEGAL DECLARATION
1, the owner of record of this property, have completed this form accurately and declare that all statements
here are true. | do hereby grant official representatives of the county authorization to inspect the subject

property.

Property owner signaturea«w_ % . Date ‘;’4 S5~

Y

LAND USE PERMIT APPLICATION PACKAGE -  PAGE4OF 16
SAN Luis OBisPO COUNTY PLANNING & BUILDING Juwy 1, 2015
http:/mww.slocounty.ca.gov/planning.htm PLANNING@CO.SLO.CA.US



LAND USE PERMIT APPLICATION

San Luis Obispo County Department of Planning and Building File No

Type of project: 0 Commercial O Industrial O Residential O Recreational Q Other

Describe any modifications/adjustments from ordinance needed and the reason for the request (if
applicable): ot

Describe existing and future access to the proposed project site: Poee - e Ave

Surrounding parcel ownership: Do you own adjacent property? ﬁ Yes U No
If yes, what is the acreage of all property you own that surrounds the project site? 5c06 4.

Surrounding land use: What are the uses of the land surrounding your property (when applicable,
please specify all agricultural uses):

North: qe~( South: -

East: Q-( West: 2

For all projects, answer the following:

Square footage and percentage of the total site (approximately) that will be ed for the foljowing:
Buildings: | Q’L?b sq. feet g; % Landscaping: 2(7 ? sq. feet 4’?0 %

———— 1 ene————

Paving: 200 sq.feet \R % Other (specify)

Total area of all paving and structures: 74 28 Wsq. feet 0 acres
Total area of grading or removal of ground cover: _+/~ 40 O M'sq. feet _ O acres
Number of parking spaces proposed: z Height of tallest structure: Z‘f"

Number of trees to be removed: © Type:

Setbacks: Front_{ O Right__& A Left__at 2 Back___ /0
Proposed water source: ([ On-sitewell ([ Shared well ~ Q Other

Elﬁommunity System - List the agency or company responsible for provision: Qozo 'tzo%\m
o0 you have a valid will-serve letter? QYes QNo (If yes, please submit copy)

Proposed sewage disposal: {1 Individual on-site system Q Other .
ommunity System - List the agency or company responsible for sewage disposal: Coogv ¢ 05 C,umx)wj
o you have a valid will-serve letter? QvYes QONo (If yes, please submit copy) U

Fire Agency: List the agency responsible for fire protection: CONL Ve 0o .ﬁ‘ =

For commercial/industrial projects answer the following:

Total outdoor use area: Qsq.feet O acres

Total floor area of all structures including upper stories: _ sq. feet

For residential projects, answer the following: A)

Number of residential units: L Number of bedrooms per unit:

Total floor area of all structures including upper stories, but not garages and c_ﬁp)orts: tl55 o4
Total of area of the lot(s) minus building footprint and parking spaces: - 7900 24,

LAND USE PERMIT APPLICATION PACKAGE " PAGE6 OF 16
SaN Luis Osispo COUNTY PLANNING & BUILDING Juy 1,2015

http:/iwww.slocounty.ca.gov/planning.htm PLANNING@CO.SLO.CA.US



ENVIRONMENTAL DESCRIPTION FORM

San Luis Obispo County Department of Planning and Building File No

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires all state and local agencies to consider and
mitigate environmental impacts for their own actions and when permitting private projects. The Act also
requires that an environmental impact report (EIR) be prepared for all actions that may significantly affect
the quality of the environment. The information you provide on this form will help the Department of

Planning and Building determine whether or not your project will significantly affect the quality of the
environment.

To ensure that your environmental review is completed as quickly as possible, please remember

to:

a.
b.

C.

d.

Answer ALL of the questions as accurately and completely as possible.

Include any additional information or explanations where you believe it would be helpful or where
required. Include additional pages if needed.

If you are requesting a land division or a re-zoning, be sure to include complete information about
future development that may result from the proposed land division or rezoning.

Include references to any reports or studies you are aware of that might be relevant to the questions
asked or the answers you provide.

Should a determination be made that the information is inaccurate or insufficient, you will be required to
submit additional information upon request.

Physical Site Characteristic Information

Your site plan will also need to show the information requested here:

1. Describe the topography of the site:
Level to gently rolling, 0-10% slopes: 4950 acres 5.
Moderate slopes of 10-30%: acres
Steep slopes over 30%: acres
2. Are there any springs, streams, lakes or marshes on or near the site? Q Yes B;elo
If yes, please describe:
3. Are there any flooding problems on the site or in the surrounding area? QYes BENo
If yes, please describe:
4, Has a drainage plan been prepared? QOYes ®No
If yes, please include with application.
5. Has there been any grading or earthwork on the project site? Q Yes éNo
If yes, please explain:
6. Has a grading plan been prepared? QYes dNo
If yes, please include with application.
7. Are there any sewer ponds/waste disposal sites on/adjacent to the project? O Yes @ No
8. Is a railroad or highway within 300 feet of your project site? - QYes ANo
9. Can the proposed project be seen from surrounding public roads? Q Yes ? No
If yes, please list:
LAND USE PERMIT APPLICATION PACKAGE PAGE 7 OF 16
SAN Luis OBisPO COUNTY PLANNING & BUILDING Juwry 1, 2015

http://www.slocounty.ca.gov/planning.htm PLANNING@CO.SLO.CA.US



Water Supply Information
1. What type of water supply is proposed?

Q Individual well Q Shared well h(Community water system
2. What is the proposed use of the water?
Residential Q Agricultural - Explain

Q Commercial/Office - Explain
Q Industrial - Explain

3.  What is the expected daily water demand associated wi‘h the project?

4. How many service connections will be required?

5. Do operable water facilities exist on the site?

Yes O No If yes, please describe: ___Ex t 45"'\ wq W\n-‘l‘v <

6. Has there been a sustained yield test on proposed or existing wells?
QYes Q No If yes, please attach.

7. Does water meet the Health Agency's quality requirements?
Bacteriological? @ Yes QNo
Chemical? Yes Q No
Physical Yes Q No
Water analysis report submitted? d Yes Q No

8. Please check if any of the following have been completed on the subject property and/or submitted to
County Environmental Health.
Q Well Driller's Letter Q Water Quality Analysis U OK or O Problems
&-Will Serve Letter Q Pump Test Hours, G.P.M.
Q Surrounding Well Logs  Q Hydrologic Study Q Other

Please attach any letters or documents to verify that water is available for the proposed project.

Sewage Disposal Information

If an on-site (individual) subsurface sewage disposal system will be used:

1. Has an engineered percolation test been accomplished?
Q Yes Q No If yes, please attach a copy.
2. What is the distance from proposed leach field to any neighboring water wells? feet
3. Wil subsurface drainage result in the possibility of effluent reappearing in surface water or on
adjacent lands, due to steep slopes, impervious soil layers or other existing conditions?

Q Yes Q No
4. Has a piezometer test been completed?
Q Yes Q No

5. Will a Waste Discharge Permit from the Regional Water Quality Control Board be required?
Q Yes O No (a waste discharge permit is typically needed when you exceed 2,500 gallons per

day)

If a community sewage disposal system is to be used:

1. s this project to be connected to an existing sewer line? H'Yes O No
Distance fo nearest sewer fine: __ %- 2.0° _ Location of connection: _Ca.c & Ave
2. What is the amount of proposed flow? G.P.D.
3. Does the existing collection treatment and disposal system have adequate additional capacity to
accept the proposed flow? &Yes Q No
LAND USE PERMIT APPLICATION PACKAGE PAGE 8 OF 16
SaN Luis OBiSPO COUNTY PLANNING & BUILDING Jury 1,2015

http:/Amvww.slocounty.ca.gov/planning.htm PLANNING@CO.SLO.CA.US



Solid Waste Information

1.

el S

What type of solid waste will be generated by the project?

Domestic  Q Industrial  Q Agricultural  Q Other, please explain?
Name of Solid Waste Disposal Company: _ YWers0 . i, Prog ]
Where is the waste disposal storage in relation to buildings? _(asaqe

Does your project design include an area for collecting recyclable materials and/or composting
materials? §Yes Q No

Community Service Information

OrON=

Name of School District: CM Lo ge«»c,u:&—**“l
Location of nearest police station: @22 Ozzs5 )
Location of nearest fire station: Codd Do _PTve

Location of nearest public transit stop: __ Deear Ave

Are services (grocery/other shopping) within walking distance of the project? XYes Q No
If yes, what is the distance? X feet/miles

Historic and Archeological Information

1.

Please describe the historic use of the property:
£Ex . 2"‘11’-—0‘1 ST

Are you aware of the presence of any historic, cultural or archaeological materials on the project site
orin the vicinity? Q Yes BiNo

If yes, please describe:
Has an archaeological surface survey been done for the project site? QOYes xNo
If yes, please include two copies of the report with the application.

Commercial/Industrial Project Information

Only complete this section if you are proposing a commercial or industrial project or zoning

change.
1. Days of Operation: Hours of Operation:
2. How many people will this project employ?
3. Will employees work in shifts?  Q Yes O No

If yes, please identify the shift times and number of employees for each shift

4. Wil this project produce any emissions (i.e., gasses, smoke, dust, odors, fumes, vapors)?
Q Yes Q No Ifyes, please explain:
5. Wil this project increase the noise level in the immediate vicinity? Q Yes Q No
If yes, please explain:
(f loud equipment is proposed, please submit manufacturers estimate on noise output.)
6. What type of industrial waste materials will result from the project? Explain in detail:
7. WIill hazardous products be used or stored on-site? U Yes Q No
If yes, please describe in detail:
8. Has a traffic study been prepared? Q Yes QNo I[fyes, please attach a copy.
LAND USE PERMIT APPLICATION PACKAGE PAGE 9 OF 16
SAN Luis OsisPO COUNTY PLANNING & BUILDING JuLy 1,2015

http://www.slocounty.ca.gov/planning.htm PLANNING@CO.SLO.CA.US



9. Please estimate the number of employees, customers and other project-related traffic trips to or from
the project: Between 7:00 - 9:00 a.m. Between 4:00 to 6:00 p.m.
10. Are you proposing any special measures (carpooling, public transit, telecommuting) to reduce
automobile trips by employees O Yes QO No
If yes, please specify what you are proposing:
11. Are you aware of any potentially problematic roadway conditions that may exist or resuit from the
proposed project, such as poor sight distance at access points, connecting with the public road?
QYes Q No If yes, please describe:

Agricultural Information

Only complete this section if your site is: 1) Within the Agricultural land use category, or 2)
currently in agricultural production.

1. Is the site currently in Agricultural Preserve (Williamson Act)? QYes QONo
2. If yes, is the site currently under land conservation contract? QYes O No
3. Ifyour land is currently vacant or in agricultural production, are there any restrictions on the crop

productivity of the land? That is, are there any reasons (i.e., poor soil, steep slopes) the land cannot
support a profitable agricultural crop? Please explain in detail:

Special Project Information

1. Describe any amenities included in the project, such as park areas, open spaces, common
recreation facilities, etc.(these also need to be shown on your site plan):

2. Will the development occur in phases? O Yes Q No
If yes describe:
3. Do you have any plans for future additions, expansion or further activity related to or connected with
this proposal? Q Yes Q No If yes, explain:

4. Are there any proposed or existing deed restrictions? Q Yes O No
If yes, please describe:

Energy Conservation Information

1. Describe any special energyﬂng_servation measures or building materials that will be incorporated
into your project *; (T[e 24

*The county’s Building Energy Efficient Structures (BEES) program can reduce your construction
permit fees. Your building must exceed the California State Energy Standards (Title 24) in order to
qualify for this program. If you are interested in more information, please contact the Building
Services Division of the Department of Planning and Building at (805) 781-5600.

Environmental Information

1. Listany mitigati%i ?zasures that you propose to lessen the impacts associated with your project:-

LAND USE PERMIT APPLICATION PACKAGE PAGE 10 OF 16
SaN Luis OBisPO COUNTY PLANNING & BUILDING Juwr 1, 2015
http:/Awww.slocounty.ca.gov/planning.htm PLANNING@CO.SLO.CA.US



2. Are you aware of any unique, rare or endangered species (vegetation or wildlife) associated with the
project site? Q Yes ¥4 No
If yes, please list:
3. Are you aware of any previous environmental determinations for all or portions of this property?
Q Yes GNo
If yes, please describe and provide “ED” number(s):

Other Related Permits

1. List all permits, licenses or govermnt approvals that will be required for your project (federal, state
and local): v Wﬂl ~

(If you are unsure if additional permits are required from other agencies, please ask a member of the
Planning Department staff currently assigned in either Current Planning or the Environmental

Division.)
LAND Use PERM:T APPLICATION PACKAGE PAGE 11 0F 16
SaN Luis OBisPO COUNTY PLANNING & BUILDING Juwy 1, 2015

http:/Amww.slocounty.ca.gov/planning.htm PLANNING@CO.SLO.CA.US



RESIDENTIAL ADDITION FOR:

CAYUCO S,

DIANE SHEL]

CALIFORNIA.

=2

GENERAL NOTES

SYMBOLS ¢ ABBREVIATIONS

RESIDENTIAL CAL GREEN MANDATORY MEASURES

SHEET INDE X

PROJECT

DATA

John MacDonald, Architect
2813 Santa Barbara Avenue
Cayucos, CA 23420
Office 805.995.1398

FAX 805.995,1544

John MacDonsld EXPRESSLY RESERVES

ITé COMMON LAW COPTRIGHT AND OTHER PROPERTY
RIGHTS IN THESE DOCUMENTS. THESE DOCUMENTS ARE
NOT TO BE REPRODUCED, CHANGED, OR COPIED IN ANY
FORM OR MANNER WHATEOEVER. NOR ARE THEY TO BE
ABSIGNED TO ANY THIRD PARTY WITHOUT FIRST OBTAINING
THE EXPREESS URITTEN PERMISSION AND CONSENT OF

John MacDonaid

§ 8

[

L

¥

AL WORK MATERIALS AND METHODS SHALL BE N CONFORMANCE
WTH THE 2010 CBC CODE, 20'0 CME, 1010 £PE, 3010 CEC ,
200 Cailfor's Enargy Code

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESEONSELE FOR
VERIFYNG ALL DIMENSIONS AND EXISTING CONDITIONS THEREON
BERCRE COMMENCING LIORK. REFORT ANY DISCREPANCIES AND/OR
POTENTIAL FROBLEMS TO THE ARCHITECT SRIOR TO PROCEEDING
WITH ASPECTED WORK.

CONTRACTORS ARE RESFPONMSLE FOR ALL WORK REGARDLESS OF
THE LOCATION OF THE NFORMAT.ON OF THE DOCUMENTS.

CONTRACTOR SHALL CONPIRM THAT PROFER FINISH GRADE
ELEVATIONS HAVE BEEN PRO/IDED AT THE PERIMETER OF

THE BULDNG ARELS, REFER TO BULDING AND ADJOINING

AREAS, REFER TC BULDING PLANS . REFORT ANY DISCREFANCES
1O THE DESGNER PRIOR TC PROCEEDING WiTH ROUGH GRADNG.

PROVIDE PIPE GUARDS AT ALL ABOVE GROUND UTILITY
EQUIEMENT AS DICTATED BY GOVERNING AGENCIES,

PROVIDE OR VEHICULAR

TEMPORARY GUARD RALS, AND / OR CANOPIES AS REQUIRED
BY THE LOCAL AGENCIES OR AS NECESSARY FOR PEDESTRIAN
AND VENICULAR SAFETY.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR 18 SOLE.Y RESFONSBLE FOR
COORDNATION AMONG HIS VAR OUS SUBCONTRACTORS.

IN THE BVENT OF DISCREPANCIES SETUEEN ANT DRAUNGS
AND/OR SPECPICATIONS, THE MORE COSTLY OR MORE
RESTRICTIVE CONDITIONS SHALL BE THE CONTRACT
REGUIREMENT, UNLESS OTHERUISE STATED IN WRITING, RROM
THE DESIGNSR,

GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL COORDINATE ALL UNDERGROUND
ITEMS WiTw T = muw BLECTRICAL. GAB, TELEPHONE, AND
cABLE Tv

CONTRACTOR 8HALL VERIFY DIMENSIONS OF ALL EQUISMENT
MANJFACTLRERS.

GENERAL CONTRACTOR HALL NCTIRY ALL ASPLICABLE LOCAL
GOVERNING, AUTHORITES AND UTILITES PRIOR *C SOVERNG.
UP ANY WORK RECURING NSPECTION.

PROVIDE Gi.VANIC FROTECTION BETUEEN DISSIMLAR “MATERIALS
UHERE REQURED.

ALL PENETRATIONS w_au ANY SURSACE SHALL BE
SEALED u SEALANT MATERIAL

UNLESS OTHERWSE NOTED, ALL EXTERICR AND NTERIOR
EXPOSED METAL, TRIM, TREILAGERAILINGS, MOLDING, SRAMES,
CASTING, BTC.. SHALL BE PANTED,

SEE SOLS REPORT FOR RECOMMENDATIONS REGARCING
CORROBIVE BOILS. ALL METALLIC UTILITY LINES SHALL BE
CORROBION PROTECT'ON.

SRECEY UEATHER-RESSTANCE BARRIER AT AL EXTERICR
WALLS UBC 14021 NOTE TWC (2) LAYERS OF GRADE
TYPE RAPER REQURED OVER UCOD BASED SHEATING

THE INBULATION INSTALLER SHALL FOST IN A CONSSICUOUS.
PLACE IN THE BLDG. A BTATE INSULATION CERTISICATE SIGNED
BY THE INSTALLER STATING THAT THE INSULATION 18
CONSISTENT WTH THE FLANS AND CONRORMS TO THE STATE
ENERGY REGULATIONS NOTE ON SLANS T'TLE 24 .

PART 12, CHAPTER -3 BTANDARDS FOR INSULATING MATERIAL

THE BUILDER BHALL PROVIDE THE BLDG OWNER MANAGER AND
ORIGINAL OCCURANTS WITH A LIST OF THE FEATURE, MATERIALS,
COMPONENTS AND MECHANICAL DEVICES INSTALLED IN THE
BULDNG: INSTRUCTIONS ON =OU TO USE T™EM EFRICIENTLY
AND, MANTENANCE FO® EFSICIENT ORERATION NOTE ON THE
PLANS TITLE 24 . SECTION '0-10%®)

ALL $ROP UELDING SHALL BE DONE BY AN "APFROVED' ICBO
FABRICATING SHOP PRIOR TO ANY STEEL BENG FABRICATED
AND SENT TO THE JCRSITE. THE FABRICATING COMPANY SHALL
BE APPROVED BY THE DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING AND SAFETY
PER CBC . SECTION NGLY

mt CONTRACTOR 8HALL FELD VERFY THE BITE CONDITIONS A8
N THE PLANS AND REPORT ANY DISCRE®ANCIES
ro - DESIGNER BERRE SROCEEDING WiTH i HORE.

UNLESS NOTED OTHERWSE AS INCICATED, DIMENSION® ARE TO
CENTER LINES OF COLUMNS, AND TO FACE OF WALLS.

ALL CONSTRUCTION AND DETALS SHALL COMPLY WITH T-E GOVERNNG
AGENCY'S BULDING CODE AND IT8 ADOPTIONS, AND WITH ALL
OTHER APFLICABLE PEDERAL, STATE AND LOCAL ORDINANCES.

RITTEN DIMENSIONS GOVERN, DO NOT SCALE DRAWINGS. ANY
QUESTICNS REGARDING GAME SHALL BE REFERED T2 THE DESGNER.

ANY/ALL LUMBER IN CONTACT WTH CONCRETE FLOOR OR FOOTINGS
SHALL BE F.G. REDULOOD OR SRESSURE TREATED, "WOLMANIZED"
CBC. SECTION 1306.4

ALL FRAMING LUMBER SHALL BE GRADE MARKED WITH QUALTY PER
CB.C. (CALFORNIA BULDING CODE) REQUREVENTS.

USE APPROVED FLABING MATERIALS AT ALL EXTERIOR CRENINGS,
UNLESS NOTED OT-ERWISE, ALL SHEET METAL 8-ALL BE 24 GAUGE
G.i. OR BETTER, BAINTED UIT- G.. VINTL WASH PRMER AND A INC
DUST PRINER, METAL 48 By

SROVIDE ONE 15 POUND UATERPROOR FELT MINMUM UNDER ALL
EXTERIOR COVERING.

ALL EXTERIOR WALL OPENNGS, FLASHING, COUNTER SLASHING,
EXPANSION JOINTS, B-ALL BE CONSTRUCTED N 8UCH A MANNER

TO MAKE THEM WATERFROOF: CAULK AND FLABH WHERE NECESSARY
FOR A COMPLETE AND UORKABLE INTALLATION,
CERTFIED INSULATION MATERIALS TITLE 34 SECTION lie,
INSULATION INSTALLED T MEET FLAME SPREAD £ND MO
DENSITY REQUREENTS

NCT MORE THAN 28 AND 8MOKE NOT MORE THAN 450
AR INFILTRATION 1S MINM ZED BY SFECRCATION OF TESTED
MANUFACT.RED DOORS AND WINDOUS AND PROPER SEALING ANC
VEATHER-STRIPPING .

CONTRACTORS MUST GANG AND CONCEAL FROM VIEL ROOR VENTS
UHEREVER POSSIBLE,

ROOF SRAIN DOUN SROUTS MUST NOT DRAIN ONTO HARD C® BE
VISBLE FROM TRASFIC AREAS.

AL EQUAL" BUBBTITUTIONS MUST B2 SUBMITTED TC. AND ARPROVED
BY THE BULDING OFFICIAL PRIOR TO INSTALLATION OF THE ITEM,
FROVIDE PRESSURE REGULATOR ROR WATER SERVICE UHERE STATIC
PRESSURE EXCEEDS 80 P8I, (CPC 608.2)

ALL OR "EQUAL" SUBSTITUTIONS MUST BE SUBMITED 70,

AND APPROVED BY THE BULDING OFIC'AL PRIOR

TO INSTALLATION CF THE ITEM

O
®

T =

Q——_.

COLUMN LiES, GRD LINES A

DOOR 8YMBCL AL

WNDEW STHBOL.

wESION B8RO
CLOUD ARCUND REVISION BTN

OR DATUM POINT
cone.
SECTION IDENTIECAT O% CONT.
S-EET LHERE SECTION i
8 DRAWN Al
DET.
&= .=
SHEET NUMBER DG
=1 E
KEYNOTES
£A
corcree ea.
EIII sy ez e
NNNNANNNY CoNCRETE BLOCK -
GYPSUN BOARD EQ.
——— O DOLBLE Lines
AT SHALL SCALE Exis.
B sammewsnn Exr.
gTe.
S oo o
BROPERTY LINE F.G.
e,
2 NEW FiNish- GRADE &
SHOUN HORZENTALLY LR,
5% Fd
EXIETING GRADE Fl.
NEU R FINISHED
_ ®TC)
contours
—_— BXISTNG CONTOURS e
TOP OF WALL fre
9 a.
To® oF cure.
@A
"
To® oF mAVE-ENT ave.
LR GALy.
sTaNDARD we
STR.CTURAL W,
TOP OF PARAPET e,
ToR OF FOOTING. na
(TOR CF FLUS CURS) N MAX,
TOP OF PAVING MIN
ToP OF wALL ML
M YV:CI—L N
sest
w W NG
we. wiERE cocume NiE,
REINE. RENFORCEMENT oc.
RET, RETENTION L
SEC. sECTION SCHDL.

Aeove

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
ADLACENT

ASSMED PROPERTY LINE
BEGN CURS RETURN
BOTTOM CF FOOTING
BOTTOM OF RASCIA
204RD

BETUEEN

CATCH BABIN

CENTERLINE

cLeanouT

cLEaR

CONCRETE MASONRY UNT
CONCREE

CONTRLOUS

cusic YARS

EXISTNG GRADE
ELEvATION
ELECTRICAL.
BEvATION
£cuaL

EXIBTING
EXPANSON
ETCETERA

BINSH

FINSH GRACE
FNSH PAVNG
=Loor

SIRE HYDRANT
FLOW LiNE
FUTURE TC® OF PAY NG
or ETE

SUTURE TOP OF CuRB
=0CTNG

auTTER

GausE

. GYRSUM BOARD

GALVANZED
waNiC AR
SEGHT

iGH BONT
JeNT

HAXIUN
N

METAL

NORTH

NATURAL GRADE
NOT N CONTRACT

PROPERTY LINE
SCHEDULE

THE BUILDING OCCUPANT

v.0.C.'s

WITH VOC AND OTHER TOXIC LIMITS.

PRODUCT WEIGHT!

LIMIT FINISH MATERIALS HAVE BEEN USED.

FLOORSCORE PROGRAM.

FORMALDEHYDE EMISSION STANDARDS.

INTERIOR MOISTURE CONTROL

GRADE FOUNDATIONS.

FRAMING 16 CHECKED BEFORE ENCLOGURE.

IN EVERY BATHROOM,

UBING THE FOLLOWING METHODS:

ACCA MANUAL J OR EQUIVALANT.

OR EQUIVALENT,

INSTALLATION OF HVAC 8YSTEMS,

INSPECTING.

WHICH SHOW SUBISTANTIAL CONFORMANCE.

ALL CONTRACTORS ANDSUBCONTRACTORS SmALL HAVE A CURRENT
BUSNESS LICENCE PRIOR TO PERMIT ‘SSUANCE

ALL cosmu.svmu AND/OR SUNER-BULDERS MUST SUBMT CERTIFICATE
CF LORKER'S COMPENSATON NSURANCE COVERAGE PRIOR TO THE
wm: OF A BULDNG PERMIT PER CALFORNIA LABOR CODE, SECTION

—=\RAL CONTRACTORS AND/OR OUNER-BULDERS 8-~ALL COMPLETE AND.
SUBMT A CONTRACTOR'S LIST FROM THE DEPARTHENT OF CODE
COMPLIANCE PRIOR TO REQUEST 0T RINAL NEPECTION,

DEVELOPER / CONTRACTOR / OUNER 16 RESPCNSIBLE FOR THE
VERIFICATION OF EXISTING CURE (5% EDGE CF STREET PAVING IF NO
PAVING CURS EXISTING) LOCATION FROM THE PROPERTY LINE (8) WTw

PUBLIC WORS DESARTMENT,

APPROVED TEMPORARY SANTARY PACLTIES ( LE CHEMICAL TOLETS )
BHALL BE (N TWE CONSTRUCTION SITE PRIOR TO REQUEST FOR FIRST
INSPECTION ). HEALTH AND SASETY CODE SECT.ON B406.

covmu."vm AND/OR OUNER SHALL FROVIDE A TRAS~ BIN TO INSURE

OF ALL BULDING MATERIALS.
STCRAGE OF BULDNG MATERIALS O DEBRIS SHALL BE CONFINED TO ™nE
LOT KO WHICH THE PERMIT 16
NCT BE UTILIZED FOR THS PURSOSE UN.E6S WRITTEN PERMISSION OF TwE
OUWNER I8 ON FILE (T THIS OFRICE. THE FUBL'C RIGHT-ORWAY 8<ALL BE
MAINTANED IN A CLEAR CONDITION AT ALL TIMES,

ISBUED. ADUAZENT VACANT SROPERTIES MAY

JOINT® AND OPENINGS. ANNULAR SPACES AROUND PIFES, ELECTRIC
CABLES, CONQUITS OR OTHER OPENINGS IN PLATES AT EXTERIOR

WALLS AHALL BE PROTECTED AGAINST TRE PASSAGE OF RODENTS

BY CLOSING 8UCH OPENINGS WITH CEMENT MORTAR, CONCRETE MASONRY
OR SIMILAR METHODS ACCEPTABLE TO ENFORCING ACENCY.

A MINIMUM OF TO% OF THE CONSTRUCTION WASTE GENERATED AT THE
SITE & DIVERTED TC RECTYCLE OR SALVAGE.

AN OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE MANUAL SHALL BE PROVIDED TO
OWNER.

ANY INSTALLED GAS FIREPLACE SHALL BE DIRECT-VENT SEALED-

COMBUSTION TYPE. ANY INSTALLED WOOD STOVE OR PELLET 8TOVE

SHALL COMPLY WITH US EPA FPHASE Il EMISSION LIMITS WHERE

APPLICABLE. WOODSTOVES, PELLET STOVES AND FIREPLACES
SHALL AL8O COMPLY WITH LOCAL ORDINANCES.

DOCUMENTATION SHALL BE PROVIDED TO VERIFY THAT COMPLIANT
VOC LIMIT FINISH MATERIALS HAVE BEEN USED.

DUCT OPENINGS AND OTHER RELATED AIR DISTRIBUTION COMPONENTS
OPENINGS SHALL BE COVERED DURING CONSTRUCTION,

ADHESIVES, SEALANTS AND OTHER COATINGS SHALL BE COMPLIANT
PAINTS, STAINS AND OTHER COATINGS SHALL BE COMPLIANT WITH
D MR LIMIT® FOR ROC AND OTHER TOXIC COMPOUNDS.

AEROSOL PAINTS AND COATINGS SHALL BE COMPLIANT WiTH PRODUCT
WEIGHTED MIR LIMITS FOR ROC AND OTHER TOXIC COMPOUNDS,

DOCUMENTATION SHALL BE PROVIDED TO VERIFY THAT COMPLIANT vOC

CARPET AND CARPET SYSTEMS SHALL BE COMPLIANT WITH VOC LIMITS,
50% OF FLOOR AREA RECEIVING RESILIENT FLOORING SHALL COMPLY
WITH THE VOC-EMISSIONS LIMITS DEFINED IN THE COLLABORATIVE FOR

HIGH PERFORMANCE SCHOOLS (CHPS) LOW-EMITTING MATERIALS LIST OR
BE CERTIFIED UNDER THE RESILIENT FLOOR COVERING INSTITUTE (RFCL)

PARTICLE BOARD, MEDIUM DENSITY FIBERBOARD (MDF) AND HARDUOOD
PLYWOOD USED IN INTERIOR FINISH STSTEMS SHALL COMPLY WITH LOW

VAPOR RETARDER AND CAPILLARY BREAK IS INSTALLED ON SLAB ON
MOISTURE CONTENT OF BUILDING MATERIALS USED IN WALL AND FLOOR
EXHAUST FANS WHICH TERMINATE OUTSIDE THE BUILDING ARE INSTALLED

WHOLE HOUSE EXHAUST FANS S8HALL HAVE INSULATED LOUVERS OR
COVERS WHICH CLOSE WHEN THE FAN I8 OFF. COVERS OR LOUVERS
SHALL HAVE MINIMUM INSULATION VALUE OF R-4.2

DUCT 8YSTEMS ARE 8IZED, DESIGNED AND EQUIPMENT 18 SELECTED

1. ESTABLISHED HEAD LOSS AND WEAT GAIN VALUES ACCORDING TO

2. BIZE DUCT SYSTEME ACCORDING TO ACC 23-D OR EGUIVALENT.

3. SELECT HEATING AND COOLING EQUIPMENT ACCORDING TO ACCA 36-5
HYAC SYSTEM INSTALLERS ARE TRAINED AND CERTIFIED IN THE PROPER

SPECIAL INSPECTORS EMPLOTED BY THE ENFORCING AGENCY MUST BE QUALIFIED
AND ABLE TO DEMONSTRATE COMPETANCE IN THE DISCIPLINE THEY ARE

VERIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE WiTH THIS CODE MAY INCLUDE CONSTRUCTION
DOCUMENTATS, PLANS, SPECIFICATIONS, BUILDER OR INSTALLER CERTIFICATION
INSPECTION REPORTS, OR OTHER METHODS ACCEPTABLE TO THE ENFORCING AGENCY

SHEET * CONTENTS
-1 TITLE PAGE
Al SITE PLAN
A2 EXISTING FLOOR PLAN
A-3 LOWER FLOOR PLAN
A4 UPPER FLOOR PLAN
A-5 EXTERIOR ELEVATIONS
A5 EXTERIOR ELEVATIONS

EROSION CONTROL AND BEST MANAGEMENT PRACTICES
MUET BE IN PLACE AND RUNCTIONAL PRIOR TO THE FIRST
INSPECTION. NO INSPECTIONS CAN BE PERFORMED IF THEY
ARE NOT IN PLACE OR HAVE FAILED TO PROVIDE

EROSION CONTROL. FAILURE TO MAINTAIN EROSION CONTROL
WiLL CAUSE INSPECTIONS TO BE DELATED UNTIL EROSION
CONTROL MEASURES ARE FUNCTIONAL,

OWNER:

DIANE SHELBY

525 PACIFIC AVE.
CAYUCOS, CA
925-289-2286

LEGAL DESCRIPTION:

525 PACIFIC AVENUE
CAYUCOS, CA

LOT 14 BLOCK &

PASO ROBLES BEACH *
APN O&4-144-011
SQUARE FOOTAGE:
EXISTING LIVING

FIRST FLOOR ADDITION
SECOND FLOOR ADDITION

2 &.F.

25 S.F,
858 S.F.

TOTAL LIVING
GARAGE

DECKING

LOT 8IZE

ALLOWABLE GSA (55%)

PROPOSED GSA (55%)

2285 S.F.

231 &.F.

415 S.F.

4539 S.F.

24%¢ S.F.

2486 S.F,

YICINITY MAP

APPLICABLE CODES

2013 CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE (CHAP. 4, 6 & 8)

2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE (CBC)
2013 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE (CRC)
2013 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE (CEC)
2012 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE (CMC)
2012 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE (CPC)
2013 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE (CFC)

CALIFORNIA TITLE 24: CALIFORNIA STATE ENERGY AND

ACCESSIBILITY STANDARDS

2013 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
COUNTY BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION ORDINANCE - TITLE 19
COUNTY COASTAL ZONE LAND USE ORDINANCE - TITLE 23

COUNTY FIRE CODE ORDINANCE - TITLE le
COUNTY LAND USE ORDINANCE - TITLE 22
2013 CALIFORNIA ENERGYT CODE

2007 MaeQuest e

PROJECT TEAM

ARCHITECT:

John MacDonald, Architect
2813 Sonta Barbera Averve
Cayucos, CA 23430
Office 805.925.1338

FAX 805,925,544

TITLE-24 -

STRUCTURAL :

SOILS ENGINEER:

WRITTEN DIMENSIONS ON THESE DOCUMENTS SHALL HAVE
PRECEDENCE OVER S8CALED DIMENSIONS. CONTRACTORS
SHALL VERIFY AND BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ALL DIMENSIONS
AND CONDITIONS ON THE JOB AND 8HALL REPORT ANT
TO THE ENG! ND T FOR
RESCLUTION PRICR TO COMMNECING LORK IN QUESTICN.

RESIDENTIAL ADDITION FOR
DIANE SHELBY
525 PACIFIC AVENUE
CAYUCOS, CA

DRAWN BY: JHM
DATE: 2.6.15
REVISIONS DATE

SHEET

T-I

oF 1 SHEETS




EROSION CONTROL AND BEST MANAGEMENT PRACTICES
MUST BE IN PLACE AND FUNCTIONAL PRIOR TO THE FIRST
INSPECTION. NO INSPECTIONS CAN BE PERFORMED IF THEY
ARE NOT IN PLACE OR HAVE FAILED TO PROVIDE

EROSION CONTROL, FAILURE TO MAINTAIN EROSION CONTROL
WILL CAUBE INSPECTION® TC BE DELAYED UNTIL EROSION
CONTROL MEASURES ARE FUNCTIONAL.

©®

EXISTING
SEWER MANHOLE
38.33RIM

CONCRETE wALK P

GRASS

288"

o
~
.
I
'
I

FIRE SAFETY PLAN

THE APPROVED PROJECT COVERED BY THIS PERMIT

SHALL CONFORM TO THE FIRE SAFETY PLAN REQUIREMENTS
DEEMED NECESSARY BY THE FIRE DEFPARTMENT

HAVING JURISDICTION FOR THIS PERMIT. PRIOR

TO STARTING CONSTRUCTION THE PROPERTY OWNER

SHALL READ THE FIRE SAFETY PLAN AND BECOME

AWARE OF ALL NECESSARY FIRE PROTECTION REQUIREMENTS,
REQUIREMENTS MAY INCLUDE, FIRE 6PRINKLERS / SPECIAL

LOT 14

b |

'

=
|
|

i
|
|
|
|
|

BRICK|PAVER
DRIVEWAY
N

I
|
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
APN W-)Ma)'

525 PACIFIC Avat:
CAYUCOS, CA 934,

|
|
|
|
|
|
|

e

40.20'FF

e | s |

BRICK PAVER
DRIVEWAY

3LI9INVERT BOX)
38.09FL INLET

<y
33t HiGH POINT OF

STREET CROWN ON
CENTERLINE OF LOT

C/p/

SITE PLAN

DIRT PLANTER

' SAFETY GLAZING / NON-COMBUSTIBLE EXTERIOR CONSTRUCTION
4 AND ROOFING / SETBACKS / DRIVEWAY-ROADWAY REQUIREMENTS
AND OTHER SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION

SITE DRAINAGE

THE GROUND IMMEDIATELY ADJACENT TO THE FOUNDATION SHALL

BE SLOPED AWAY FROM THE BUILDING AT A SLOPE OF NOT LESS
THAN B% FOR A MINIMUM DISTANCE OF 10" MEASURED PERPENDICULAR
TO THE FACE OF WALL.

IMPERVIOUS SURFACES WITHING 10" OF BUILDING FOUNDATION SHALL
BE SLOPED MINIMUM 2% AUAY FROM BUILDING

IF PHYSICAL OBSTRUCTIONS OR LOT LINES PROHIBIT 10" OF HORIZONTAL
DISTANCE, A B% SLOPE SHALL BE PROVIDED TOAN APPROVED ALTER-
NATIVE METHOD OF DIVERTING WATER AWAY FROM FOUNDATION.
SWALES USED FOR THESE PURPOSES SHALL BE SLOPED 4 MIN.

OF 2% WHERE LOCATED WITHIN 10" OF THE BUILDING FOUNDATION,

EXISTING BUILDING

LOCAL BENCHMARK

MAG NAIL WITH BRASS WASHER
STAMPED “L8 5702" S8ET AT It OFFSET
FROM LOT CORNER ON SOUTHUESTERLY
PROJECTION OF SIDE LOT LINE
ELEVATION « 3687, NAVDSS

174" « 10"

John MacDonald, Architect
2813 Santa Barbara Avenue
Cayucos, CA 93430
Office 805.995.1298

FAX 805.995.1544

John MacDonasid EXPRESSLY RESERVES

iT6 COMMON LAW COPTRIGHT AND OTHER PROFPERTY
RIGHTS IN THESE DOCUMENTS. THESE DOCUMENTS ARE
NOT TO BE REPRODUCED, CHANGED, OR CORIED IN ANY
FORM OR MANNER WHATSOEVER. NOR ARE THEY TO BE
ASSIGNED TO ANY THIRD PARTY WITHOUT FIRST OBTAINING
THE EXPRESS WRITTEN PERMISSION AND CONSENT OF

John MacDonald

WRITTEN DIMENSIONS ON THESE DOCUMENTS SHALL HAVE
PRECEDENCE OVER ECALED DIMENSONS. CONTRACTORS
SHALL VERIFY AND BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ALL DIMENSIONS
AND CONDITIONS ON THE JOB AND SHALL REPORT ANT
DISCREPANCIES TO THE ENGINEER AND ARCHITECT FOR
RESCLUTION PRICR TO COMMENCING WORK IN GUESTION.

STRUCTURAL ENGINEER:

ENERGY ANALYSIS:

S0ILS ENGINEER:

SHELBY RESIDENCE
525 PACIFIC AVE
CAYUCOS, CA

SITE PLAN

oRAN BT e
DATE: 2.6.15
REVISIONS DATE

SHEET

A-]

OF | SHEETS




54'-0"

19'-4" 15'-4"
3-0" x 3.0"
1
BEDROOM *I 2
9
-
9 b
Q
o
30" x 3-0" 30" x 3.0"
==
9
BEDROOM *2 *
BEDROOM *3 — %
— U & .
b 9
b
)
9 b GARAGE U
- @ ke . * BATH 9
o . 1 z s =
1 (-~ " 3
o
i i 5
' : KITCHEN §!
H i GREAT ROOM
H ; EAT ROOM 3
i 3 8- 1 X X g =
£ L - Xk K|
A— Bk
. —
Q .
[§]
?
3
——— DINING
T-0" x B0 —
4
0'e" 4 o

EXISTING FLOOR PLAN

174" = |-0"

John MacDonald, Architect
2813 Santa Barbara Avenue
Cayucos, CA 23430
Office 805.995.1398

FAX 805.995,1544

John MacDonsld EXPRESSLY RESERVES

iTé COMMON LAW COPYRIGHT AND OTHER PROPERTY
RIGHTS IN THESE DOCUMENTS, THESE DOCUMENTS ARE
NOT TO BE REPRODUCED, CHANGED, OR COPIED IN ANY
FORM OR MANNER WHATBOEVER. NOR ARE THEY TO BE
ASSIGNED TO ANY THIRD PARTY WITHOUT FIRST OBTAINING
THE EXPRESS WRITTEN PERMISBION AND CONGENT OF

John MacDonald

WRITTEN DIMENSIONS ON THESE DOCUMENTS SHALL HAVE
PRECEDENCE OVER SCALED DIMENS'ONS. CONTRACTORS
SHALL VERIFY AND BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ALL DIMENSIONS
AND CONDITIONS ON THE JOB AND SHALL REPORT ANT
DISCREPANCIES TO THE ENGINEER AND ARCHITECT FOR
RESCLUTION PRICR TO COMMENZING WORK IN QUESTICN,

R B R R T
STRUCTURAL ENGINEER:

ENERGY ANALYSIS:

SOILS ENGINEER:

SHELBY RESIDENCE
525 PACIFIC AVE
CAYUCOS, CA

EXISTING
FLOOR PLAN

DRAWN BY: JHM
DATE: 2.6.15
REVISIONS DATE

SHEET

A=2

OF T SHEETS




19'-4" 154"
g ‘r. o
=
0" 0
| — ——
LN
MR
- 0
) 2w
? =
BEDROOM *| o
o
9
NS
)
a
= ¢ = EE «
-
-
\ BATH )
=9 4-0" x 40" N K 2
g i C:[] 9
|
! &'-0"
i
BEDROOM *3
) L 9
9 Y BEDROOM %2 M
; vy
- 3
T-0"
B BATH %
E}
Ai Q9
1 3
T :
= =
: ! —
; :
KITCHEN
! ! 9
s e Ak :
= ———— X X 9
a
?
N GARAGE
: 9
9 —
N i
21 8. F.
GREAT ROOM i
FEEREREECEEEE R i 2
| : 3
! : ?
: : DINING
: i
a i
i 8- i
A LI
i 2 I 2 80" R
9 N 9
¢ YA ? =
- 2“” =31 ”
121" 121"
.
10-e" 242"
174" = 10"

John MacDonald, Architect
2813 Santa Barbara Avenue
Cagucos, CA 23430
Office 805.9395.1398

FAX 805,995,544

John d Y

T8 COMMON LAW COPTRIGHT AND OTHER PROPERTY
RIGHTS IN THESE DOCUMENTS. THESE DOCUMENTS ARE
NOT TO BE REPRODUCED, CHANGED, OR COPIED IN ANY
FORM OR MANNER WHATSOEVER. NOR ARE THEY TO BE
ABSIGNED TO ANY THIRD PARTY WITHOUT FIRST OBTANING
THE EXPRESS WRITTEN PERMIBSION AND CONSENT OF

John MacDonaid

WRITTEN DIMENSIONS ON THESE DOCUMENTS SHALL HAVE
PRECEDENCE OVER S8CALED DMENSIONS, CONTRACTORS
SHALL VERIFY AND BE RESFCONSIBLE FOR ALL DIMENSIONS
AND CONDITIONS ON THE JOB AND BHALL REFPORT ANT
DISCREPANCIES TO THE ENGINEER AND ARCHITECT FOR
RESCLUTION PRICR TO COMMENCING WORK IN QUESTICN.

s, Tt A R e
STRUCTURAL ENGINEER:

ENERGY ANALYSIS:

SOILS ENGINEER:

SHELBY RESIDENCE
525 PACIFIC AVE
CAYUCOS, CA

REVISED LOWER
FLOOR PLAN

DRAWN BY: JHM
DATE: 2.6.15
REVISIONS DATE

SHEET

A-3

OoF 1 SHEETS




E 8'-al" &'-28" 5-1"
B S AER
I i
1 -‘(ﬂ\ !
.\‘__.___ - 1
1
i !
9 SHOWER !
= | 1
o S==3
9 — l
= 1
| s
I
BATH : =
} |
- I
9 rer - I
@« 9 !
DECK 3 ) !
9 ]
';‘ I
= I
3 .
! -
]
1
i
Al_—“"'_‘ T N
1 T
1
o . !
v 9 !
; : '
K = 1
™ S i
1
1
= = 1
Ey Q ' o
5 MASTER BEDROOM < ! =
B k) ! D
~ i =i
1
36" 3'-3k" o 15'-245" '
2 1
= 2 !
b x |
x 9 i
=\, ™ 1
o i
I
e R 76" L 1
] |
1
3 N 1
Q 9 1
) M !
x BATH » F I
K] ~ QL |
™ -
i
N | | |
| j ‘ |
1 7=
1 H i
| 1 H
i (S
= I =
y ;
1 . -
! l N N
| o
1
1
' e
; : EAMILY ROOM
]
: ) .
1 9 2
] [ x
1 N 9
| ? L
1
i R
DECK

UPPER FLOOR PLAN

174" = 10"

John MacDonald, Architect
2813 Santa Barbara Avenue
Cagucos, CA 93430
Offlce 805.995.1398

FAX 805.995,1544

John MacDonsld EXPRESELY RESERVES

IT6 COMMON LAW COPYRIGHT AND OTHER PROPERTY
RIGHTS IN THESE DOCUMENTS. THESE DOCUMENTE ARE
NOT TO BE REPRODUCED, CHANGED, OR COPIED IN ANY
FORM OR MANNER WHATSOEVER. NOR ARE THEY TO BE
ASSIGNED TO ANY THIRD PARTY WITHOUT FIRST OBTAINING
THE EXPRESS WRITTEN PERMISSION AND CONSENT OF

John MacDonald

WRITTEN DIMENSIONS ON THESE DOCUMENTS SHALL HAVE
PRECEDENCE OVER SCALED DIMENSONS. CONTRACTORS
SHALL VERIFY AND BE RESPONSISLE FOR ALL DIMENSIONS
AND CONDITIONS ON THE JOB AND BHALL REPORT ANT
DieCH CIES TO THE AND T FOR
RESCLUTION PRICR TO COMMENCING LORK IN QUESTION.

R T B AN AT R
STRUCTURAL ENGINEER:

ENERGY ANALYSIS:

S0ILS ENGINEER:

SHELBY RESIDENCE
525 PACIFIC AVE
CAYUCOS, CA

UPPER
FLOOR PLAN

DRAWN B8Y: JHM
DATE: 2.6.15
REVISIONS DATE

SHEET

A-4

OF 1 SHEETS




24-0"

John MacDonald, Architect
2813 Santa Barbara Avenue
Cagucos, CA 23430
Office 805.995.1328

FAX 805.995.1544

John MacDonsid EXPRESSLY RESERVES

T8 COMMON LAW COPTRIGHT AND OTHER PROPERTY
RIGHTS IN THESE DOCUMENTS. THESE DOCUMENTS ARE
NOT TO BE REPRODUCED, CHANGED, OR COPIED IN ANY
FORM OR MANNER WHATEOEVER. NOR ARE THEY TO BE
ABSIGNED TO ANY THIRD PARTY WITHOUT FIRST OBTAINING
THE EXPRESS WRITTEN PERMISSION AND CONSENT OF

John MacDonaid

| ——
FRONT ELEVATION
174" = 1'-0"
== == RN
[y Ll

e——— —

] - [

L

_LEFT ELEVATION
174" = V'-0"

WRITTEN DIMENSIONS ON THESE DOCUMENTS SHALL HAVE
PRECEDENCE OVER SCALED DMENSIONS. CONTRACTORS
SHALL VERIFY AND BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ALL DIMENSIONS
AND CONDITIONS ON THE JOB AND 8HALL REFORT ANT
DISCREPANCIES TO THE ENGINEER AND ARCHITECT FOR
RESCLUTICN PRICR TO COMMENCING WORK IN QUESTICN,

L300 et AR SR S R I GO
STRUCTURAL ENGINEER:

ENERGY ANALYSIS:

S0OILS ENGINEER:

SHELBY RESIDENCE
B25 PACIFIC AVE
CAYUCOS, CA

EXTERIOR
ELEVATIONS

DRAWN BY: JHM
DATE: 2.6.15
REVISIONS DATE

SHEET

A=-5

oF 1 SHEETS




REAR ELEVATION

4" = 10"

= ~z 1
IL ya - |
/ 7 =
=]
p Z— |
L e —————-—“—ﬂ
7 - s
£ T =
= = P~ F ~ =
7/ i< ; =
7 | }
/ = — |
% { 5
= = ] i L ;
& = — =l F = — |
| —1 i |
gy, e

A O DO ¢

-

BN

[TTTT
—

ﬁi

RIGHT ELEVATION

174" = 1-0"

John MacDonald, Architect
2813 Santa Barbara Avenue
Cayucos, CA 23430
Offlce 805.995.1298

FAX 805.295.1544

Jobn MacDonaid EXPRESSLY RESERVES

iT6 COMMON LAW COPTRIGHT AND OTHER PROPERTY
RIGHTS IN THESE DOCUMENTS, THESE DOCUMENTE ARE
NOT TO BE REPRODUCED, CHANGED, OR CORIED IN ANY
FORM OR MANNER WHATSOEVER. NOR ARE THEY TO BE
ASSIGNED TO ANY THIRD PARTY WITHOUT FIRST OBTAINING
THE EXPRESS WRITTEN PERMISEION AND CONSENT OF

John MacDonaid

WRITTEN DIMENSIONS ON THESE DOCUMENTS SHALL HAVE
PRECEDENCE OVER SCALED DTENS/ONS. CONTRAZTORS
SHALL VERIFY AND BE RESPONSISLE FOR ALL DIMENSIONS
AND CONDITIONS ON THE JOB AND BHALL REFORT ANT
DISCREPANCIES TO THE ENGINEER AND ARZHITECT FOR
RESCLUTION PRICR TO COMMENCING LORK IN QUESTION.

i T S S e e R
STRUCTURAL ENGINEER:

ENERGY ANALYSIS:

SOILS ENGINEER:

SHELBY RESIDENCE
525 PACIFIC AVE
CAYUCOS, CA

EXTERIOR
ELEVATIONS

DRAWN BY: JHM
DATE: 2.6.15
REVISIONS DATE

SHEET

A-O

OoF 1 SHEETS




_v;l,%%ﬁgorg%jﬂggg GLBd * ©g WYL 'ON HOvIE S3I7904 0OSvd "ATND S3S0dNNG INIWSSISSY |s6-9r-£0
40 AINNOD %vw S,8055355 ¥0J Q3UY¥dINd S dYW SIHL | 89

002 oor 0 05

SOINAYD e e

AL WM NV 0
i M LAnoRY

= TOE] OF
os
ol el b B g8
I§ | p e 3 :.r-1<1
7@ | @692
L, |81 s alelg, ;

HLYNOHS ™

B0-12-20 | Lor—B0
BPO0-0Z-20 | L0r—F0
BO-ri-20 N
yo-£2-20 N
£0-£0-01 N
£0=0-60 N
Uva ST

SNQISIAZY

n v a7 o
i [ele]] !@oo 7 001 @9 02 ool i ool 8191 ool i
bz T o 21 o [ 7 o5gl o] el 3|
slsledle KECE S CE CEe
n B @) @ «Q S °l »w P . 2]
e |ios o ;.? os |ov - o '(-J;l o : +1 ov | os ‘
N Gy T e [ PES *“g% 2% i
® o /4 ﬂoo Q)W.-K SIH F1NLS WITWD ATHINOA) HINOS”
(=] /] b5
siy




£ éoasr 75ren
EP!a mnﬁmea

ey T

..1 b i ew

Recreatmn ¢

g
7




Parcel Summary Report For Parcel # 064-144-011

San Luis Obispo County Department of Planning and Building
County Government Center San Luis Obispo, California 93408 Telephone: (805) 781-5600

People Information

Role Name and Address
OWN SHELBY DIANE

57 LIVE OAK LN DANVILLE CA 94506-
OWN SHELBY TRUST

Address Information

Status Address
P 00525 PACIFIC AV CAYU

Lot Information:

Tract/ Block /

Twnshp Range Section Community: Plan/Area: Luel: Lue2: Lue3: Lot: Flags: Misc
064144 011 0001 Cayucos Estero Plannin CAZ N

PRBCH1 0008 0014 Cayucos Estero Plannin RSF LCP SSN Y D930145P

Parcel Information

Status Description
Active PRBCH1BLS8LT 14

Notes

Tax Districts

COAST (SB1537)

CAYUCOS

SAN LUIS OBISPO JT(27,40)
CAYUCOS-MORRO
CAYUCOS COUNTY

NO. 02

CAYUCOS

Page 1 of 2

1/11/2016
8:30:16AM

ParcelSummary.rpt



1/11/2016

Parcel Summary Report For Parcel # 064-144-011 8:30:17AM
San Luis Obispo County Department of Planning and Building
County Government Center San Luis Obispo, California 93408 Telephone: (805) 781-5600
AREA NO. 10
AREA NO. 21
Case Information
Case Number: Case Status:
DRC2015-00076 REC Primary Parcel
Description:
1083 SQ FT ADDITION TO EXISTING 1172 SQ FT SFR
PMT2007-02216 FNL Primary Parcel
Description:
Electrical Panel Replacement REMOVE EXISTING 100 AMP METER MAIN AND REPLACE WITH NEW
ZON2005-00181 APV Primary Parcel
Description:
VACATION RENTAL
ZON2014-00324 APV Primary Parcel
Description:

VACATION RENTAL

Page 2 of 2 ParcelSummary.rpt



